
TOWN OF LEE Advanced Bell & Flynn Inc Brox Industries Inc Continental Paving Inc Pike Industries R & D Paving Inc CAN Bros. Construction GMI Asphalt LLC

ANNUAL PAVING CONTRACT - FY 2017 166 Granite St 69 Bunker Hill Ave 1471 Methuen St One Continental Dr 650 Peverly Hill Rd 563 So. Main St 26 Kingsbury Dr. 288 Laconia Rd

4/21/2016 Suncook, NH  03275 Stratham, NH  03885 Dracut, MA  01826 Londonderry, NH  03053 Portsmouth, NH  03801 Franklin, NH  03235 Milton, NH 03851 Belmont, NH 03220

485-9755 778-8511 978-454-9105 437-5387 436-4432 934-6745 231-0284 524-0200

sharon@advanced excavatingandpaving.comjtb@bellandflynn.com kdimambro@broxindustries.comjmaher@continentalpaving.com cmatheson@pikeindustries.com info@RDPavingInc.com canbrothersconstruction@yahoo.com sales@gmiasphalt.com

Price per ton for paving listed roads 72.90 No Bid 64.50 70.00 73.00 66.60 69.77 65.66

Price per ton for paving optional listed Eping Road 72.90 No Bid 64.50 70.00 73.00 66.60 69.77 65.66

Optional: Price per ton for leveling mix picked up at plant No Bid No Bid 64.00 59.00 57.00 N/A 59.84 60.00

Location of Plant N/A Rochester, NH Concord, NH Portsmouth, NH N/A Rochester, NH Franklin, NH

Estimated Tonnage:

1. Hayes Rd. 1035 feet long x 22 feet wide ( 1-1/4 inch compacted) 180 175 180 185 180 185 180

2. Newtown Plaines Rd. - 5178 feet long x 22-1/2 feet wide-(1-1/4 inch 

compacted) 922 905 923 1000 918 927 920

3. Clay Ln. - 562 feet long x 21- feet wide ( 1 inch compacted) 75 90 75 100 75 75 92

4. Pinkham Rd – 500 feet long x 22 feet wide (2 in base compacted) 140 85 140 150 139 140 140

5. Pinkham Rd. – 500 feet long x 22 feet wide (1 in. top compacted) 70 135 70 125 70 70 70

6. Fox Garrison Rd -  feet long x 20 feet wide (1-1/4 inch compacted) 830 820 914 1000 910 914 910

7. Cartland Rd – 1161 feet long x 22 feet wide (1 inch compacted) 395 200 162 175 64 64 80

8. Epping Rd – 1275 feet long x 19 feet wide (1-1/4 inch compacted) 190 185 192 200 192 192 191

Total Estimated Tonnage 2802 0 2595 2656 2935 2548 2567 2583

Total Estimated Cost

204,265.80$                     167,377.50$                     185,920.00$                         214,255.00$                     169,696.80$                179,099.59$                        169,599.78$                      

Escalation Clause

None
Liquid asphalt base price of 

$380.00 per NH DOT at 

time of bid

Liquid asphalt base price of 

$380.00 per NH DOT at time 

of bid

None
Liquid asphalt base price 

of $380.00 per NH DOT 

at time of bid

Liquid asphalt base price of 

$380.00 per NH DOT at time 

of bid

None
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